Job 10-A01 Furnishing and Delivery of Various Automotive Equipment No. 1

Bid Opening: November 10, 2009

DESCRIPTION

Rainbow

Chevrolet, Inc.

Honolulu
Ford, Inc.

Serveo Auto
Leeward

Cutter
Dodge

Cutter Ford,
Inc.

ltem 1 - One (1) Only, 4-Door, Hybrid-Powered
Sport Utility Vehicle, 4-Wheel Drive
Purchase Price

No Bid

$32,877.71

No Bid

No Bid

$33,233.41

Item 2 -Two (2) Only, Four, 4-Door,
Sport Utility Vehicle, 4-Wheel Drive
Purchase Price

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$47,951.11

$59,521.92

Item 3 - One (1) Only, 4-Door, Sport Utility
Vehicle, 4-Wheel Drive

Purchase Price

No Bid

$30,699.93

No Bid

No Bid

$31,919.98

Item 4 - One (1) Only, 4-Door, Sport Utility
Vehicle, 4-Wheel Drive
Purchase Price

No Bid

$27,991.29

$34,227.19

$32,097.37

$28,224.86

Item 5 - One (1) Only, 4,300 Lbs. GVWR Truck
Chassis Regular Cab w/ 6-Ft. Pickup
Body and Truck Bed Accessaries,
2-Wheel Drive
Purchase Price

$22,617.00

$24,090.30

$23,156.00

$22,433.50

No Bid

ltem 6 - One (1) Only, 4,300 Lbs. GVWWR Truck
Chassis Regular Cab w/ 6-Ft. Pickup
Body and Lift Gate, 2-Wheel Drive
Purchase Price

$23,750.00

$25,904.42

$25,323.54

$23,895.28

No Bid

Item 7 - One (1) Only, 4,600 Lbs. GVWR Truck
Chassis Extended Cab w/ 6-Ft. Pickup
Body and Truck Bed Accessories,
2-Whee| Drive
Purchase Price

$23,637.00

$24,131.06

$25,670.48

$22,205.54

$23,614.62

Item 8 - One (1) Only, 9,000 Lbs. GVWR Truck
Chassis Regular Cab w/ 8-Ft. Pickup
Body & Truck Bed Accessories,
4-Wheel Drive
Purchase Price

$35,732.00

$30,618.71

$34,970.49

No Bid

$29,720.62

NOTE: These figures are preliminary or apparent bid results of the date of bid
opening. All bids are subject to evaluation.




