Job 08-A11
Bid Opening:. May 7, 2008

Mid-Pac GP Roadway Allied Hawthorne
DESCRIPTION Machinery Solutions Machinery Cutter Ford Honofulu Ford Pacific
Item 1 - One, Rubber Tired Tractor w/
Front End Loader/Backhoe w/
Extendahoe, 4-Wheel Drive
Purchase Price $87,958.08 No Bid $90,785.30 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Monthly Lease Cost n/a h/a
item 2 - Two, Two-Wheeled Mounted
Portable Solar/Battery Powered Traffic
Arrow Board
Purchase Price No Bid $14,600.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Monthly Lease Cost
item 3 - One, 15,000 Lbs, GVWR Trailer
Purchase Price $10,471.20 No Bid $9,947.64 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Monthly Lease Cost n/a n/a
Item 4 - One, 34,000 Lbs, GVWR Trailer
Purchase Price $29,633.50 No Bid $24,607.32 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Monthly Lease Cost n/a n/a
Item 5 - One, 9,800 Lbs. GVWR Crew
Cab Truck & Chassis w/ Special Service
Body, Valve Machine & Bumper Crane
Purchase Price No Bid No Bid No Bid $92,650.00 $93,182.61 No Bid




DESCRIPTION

Mid-Pac
Machinery

GP Roadway

Solutions

Allied
Machinery

Cutter Ford

Honolulu Ford

Hawthorne

Pacific

Item 6 - Two, 9,900 Lbs. GVWR Crew
Cab Truck, Flatbed Body w/ Hydraulic
Liftgate

Purchase Price

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$76.075.40

$79,616.09

No Bid

Item 7- One, 9,200 Lbs. GVWR Truck
Cab & Chassis, Flatbed Body w/
Chemical Sprayer

Purchase Price

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$50,672.01

No Bid

Item 8 - One, 9,200 Lbs. GVWR Truck
& Chassis, 4-Wheel Drive, w/ Special
Service Body & Hydraulic Lifigate

Purchase Price

Na Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$49,134.00

$46,347.80

No Bid

NOTE: These figures are preliminary or apparent bid results of the date of bid opening. All bids are subject to evaluation.

Read By: Albert Mau/
Recorded By: Susan Yokoyama/




