Job 08-A01
Bid Opening: February 27, 2008

ORCHID ISLE RAINBOW
DESCRIPTION HONOLULU FORD CUTTER FORD AUTO CENTER CUTTER DODGE CHEVROLET
Item 1 - One, 9,600 Lbs. GVWR 4X4
Cutaway Van w/ Special Service Body
Purchase Price NO BID $47,268.04 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Monthly Lease Cost $884.38
Item 2 - Two, 4-Door, Hybrid-Powered
Sport Utility Vehicle, 2-Wheel Drive
Purchase Price NO BID $62,830.36 $56,332.00 NO BID NO BID
Monthly Lease Cost $1,181.73 $1,087.84
Item 3 - Six, 4-Door, Sport Utility
Vehicle, 4- Wheel Drive
Purchase Price $127,558.94 $143,522.46 NO BID $135,308.88 NO BID
Monthly Lease Cost $2,456.74 $2,685.31 $2,480.22
Item 4 - One, 4-Door, Sport Utility
Vehicle, 2-Wheel Drive
Purchase Price $20,645.02 $21,496.85 $21,916.00 $20,613.60 NO BID
Monthly Lease Cost $402.94 $404.08 $427.33 $377.82
Item 5 - Two, 4-Door, Sport Utility
Vehicle, 2-Wheel Drive
Purchase Price $44,274.18 $47,641.80 $45,810.00 $48,980.10 $53,156.75
Monthly Lease Cost $858.35 $891.38 $885.90 $897.80 $1,020.00




ORCHID ISLE RAINBOW
DESCRIPTION HONOLULU FORD CUTTER FORD AUTO CENTER CUTTER DODGE CHEVROLET
Item 6 - Five, 4-Door, Sport Utility
Vehicle, 4-Wheel Drive
Purchase Price $127,708.65 $130,580.95 $127,125.00 $135,385.45 $148,851.75
Monthly Lease Cost $2,458.66 $2,446.50 $2,481.60 $2,845.00
Item 7 - One, 5,000 Lbs. GVWR Truck
Chassis Regular Cab w/ 6-Ft. Pickup
Body & Truck Bed Accessories,
2-Wheel Drive
Purchase Price $15,742.89 $16,282.16 $17,710.00 $17,815.70 $19,036.00
Monthly Lease Cost $302.14 $304.64 $346.61 $326.56 $368.00
Item 8 - One, 8,650 Lbs. GVWR Truck
Cab & Chassis w/ Special Service Body
Purchase Price $33,339.61 $34,453.39 $34,065.00 $35,805.22 $37,720.00
Monthly Lease Cost $646.57 $497.65 $660.49 $656.26 $545.00
Item 9 - One, 9,900 Lbs. GVWR Crew
Cab Truck & Chassis w/ Special Service
Body, Valve Machine & Bumper Crane
Purchase Price $91,187.92 $79,839.76 $78,400.00 NO BID $92,675.00
Monthly Lease Cost $1,756.80 $1,133.72 $1,511.37 $1,333.00
{tem 10 - Two, 9,900 Lbs. GVWR Crew
Cab Truck, Flatbed Body w/ Hydraulic
Liftgate
Purchase Price $74,439.06 $73,179.02 $74,552.00 NO BID $79,206.75
Monthly Lease Cost $1,437.28 $1,039.14 $1,437.52 $1,140.00




ORCHID ISLE RAINBOW
DESCRIPTION HONOLULU FORD CUTTER FORD AUTO CENTER CUTTER DODGE CHEVROLET
item 11- One, 9,200 Lbs. GVWR Truck
Cab & Chassis, Flatbed Body w/
Chemical Sprayer
Purchase Price $47,569.37 $34,723.00 $35,000.00 NO BID $36,215.00
Monthly Lease Cost $919.67 $497.65 $678.44 $525.00
Item 12 - One, 9,900 Lbs. GVWR Truck
Crew Cab & Chassis w/ Speical Service
Body & Hydraulic Liftgate
Purchase Price $40,607.58 $38,990.56 $38,992.00 NO BID $48,345.00
Monthly Lease Cost $786.06 $556.77 $755.05 $698.00
Item 13 - One, 9,200 Lbs. GVWR Truck
& Chassis, 4-Wheel Drive, w/ Special
Service Body & Hydraulic Liftgate
Purchase Price NO BID $42,248.15 $42,080.00 NO BID $49,965.00
Monthly Lease Cost $595.58 $814.32 $720.00

NOTE: These figures are preliminary or apparent bid results of the date of bid opening. All bids are subject to evaluation.




