GOODS & SERVICES BID RESULTS

Tabulation of Bids Opened on April 12, 2006

Project: Job 06-36 Furnishing and Delivery of Various Construction Equipment, No. 4

Contact: Clifford Bajcar @ (808) 748-5867

Description HT&T HAWTHORNE | BACON ALLIED SPECTRUM

TRUCK PACIFIC UNIVERSAL | MACHINERY | TRAILERS
CENTER | CORP.

Item No. 1 - One Rubber Tired Tractor w/ NG BID NO BID NO BID $89,478.59 NO BID

Front End Loader/Backhoe , 4 Wheel Drive

with Extendahoe

Item No. 2 - One Rubber Tired Skid Steer NO BID NO BID $50,520.51 $35,624.77 NO BID

Loader w/ Attachments

ltem No. 3 - Two Rubber Track Compact NO BID NO BID $99,999.36 $103,124.34 | NO BID

Excavator w/ Atachments

Item No. 4 - One Articulated Tandem Drum NO BID $32,500.00 $31,666.46 $32,291.46 NO BID

Vibratory Roller

Item No. 5 - One 10.0 KW 2-Wheel Mounted NO BID NO BID $11,458.26 $14,479.07 NO BID

Portable Combination Light Tower-Electric

Generating Set-Welder Unit w/ Protective

Housing

Item No. 6 - One 3,500 Lbs. GVWR Trailer | NOBID | NOBID NO BID NO BID $5.932.25

Item No. 7 - One 9.999 Lbs. GVWR Trailer NO BID NO BID $8,437.45 $8,645.78 NO BID

Item No. 8 - Three, 15,000 Lbs. GVWR NO BID NO BID $31,249.80 | $32,499.78 NO BID

Trailer

ltem No. 9 - One 9,999 Lbs. GVWR Trailer | NOBID | NOBID $8,749.94 1 $9.33327 [ NOBID

Item No. 10 - One 60,000 Lbs. GVWR NO BID NO BID NO BID $59,895.45 NO BID

Payload Capacity hydraulic Tail Trailer

Item No. 11 - Two 300 Galion Trailer $66,744.87 | NO BID $70,416.22 | NOBID NO BID

Mounted
Stainless Steel Water Tank

NOTE: These figures are preliminary or apparent bid results of the date of bid opening. All bids are subject to

svaluation.



