GOODS & SERVICES BID RESULTS

Project: Job 06-35 Furnishing, Delivery, Unloading of Water Works Materials and Supplies

Contact: Lan Yoneda @ (808) 748-5521

Tabulation of Bids Opened on April 12, 2006

DESCRIPTION IRRIGATION HISCO FLUID SYSTEMS FERGUSON ISLAND CONSTRUCTION
SYSTEMS UTILITIES MATERIALS

NO BID NO BID $257,100.00 $212,382.00 $194,762.00 NO BID
Part | - Ductile Iron Pipes

$24,501.10 $26,950.00 $38,645.00 $30,028.00 $31,440.00 NO BID
Part Il - Main Line Valves (small)

$8,212.20 $10,350.00 $14,145.00 $14,885.01 $12,825.18 NO BID
Part lll - Main Line Valves (large)

$48,111.00 $45,900.00 $28,200.00 $42,018.00 NO BID NO BID
Part IV - Bronze Valves

$34,781.20 $27,325.00 $24,490.00 $27,879.80 NO BID NO BID
Part V - Hydrant Parts

$97,983.00 $95,250.00 $95,400.00 $97,728.00 $99,936.00 NO BID
Part VI - Fire Hydrants

$28,172.00 $27,750.00 $27,775.00 $28,603.25 NO BID NO BID
Part VII - Fire Hydrants (Low Profile)

NO BID $39,442.00 NO BID $39,242.00 NO BID NO BID
Part VIil - Copper Service Pipe and Fittings

$49,976.00 $40,736.00 $42,750.00 $42,118.00 NO BID NO BID
Part IX - Ball Stops & Ball Corps

$36,585.00 $51,570.00 $35,250.00 $37,965.00 $43,500.00 NO BID
Part X - Cast Iron Manhole Covers,
Frames, Meter Box Covers and Frames

NO BID $2,659.00 NO BID 353,064 .20 NO BID NO BID
Part XI - Brass Fittings

$7,924.90 $7,102.00 $10,080.00 $8,249.40 NO BID NO BID
Part Xl - Service Clamps - Bronze

$47,535.10 $45,095.00 $45,420.00 $46,295.40 $76,495.00 NO BID
Part Xlil - Ciamp Couplings - Single Band

$5,315.00 NO BID NO BID $4,695.00 NO BID NO BID
Part XIV - Pack Joint Couplings

$5,466.75 $5,280.00 $5,550.00 $5,496.75 NO BID NC BID
Part XV - Repair Clamps

NO BID NO BID $5,740.00 $5,056.00 NO BID NO BID
Part XVI - Water Meter Connections

53,825.00 NO BID NO BID $4,065.00 NO BID NO BID
Part XVHl - Wire Solder

$4,524.00 $4,800.00 $6,900.00 $7,812.00 NO BID $6,780.00
Part XVIII - Bronze Bolts, Studs, and Nuts

NO BID NO BID NO BID $2,890.00 NO BID $12,000.00
Part XIX - Abrasive Cloth

$9,102.00 $8,220.00 $8,100.00 $22,230.00 NO BID NO BID

Part XX - Miscellaneous

NOTE: These figures are preliminary or apparent bid results of the date of bid opening. All bids are subject to evaluation.




