GOODS & SERVICES BID RESULTS

Tabulation of Bids Opened on
May 26, 2010

Project: Job 10-A02 Furnishing and Delivery of Various Automotive Equipment No. 2
Contact: Albert Mau @ (808) 748-5137

Rainbow Honolulu Ford, Inc.  [Cutter Ford,
Chevrolet, Inc. Inc.

Item No.

One (1) Only, 9,700 Lb.
GVWR Truck Cab and
Chassis with Special
Service Body, Valve
Machine and Bumper
Crane.

$81,845.00

$78,879.21

$75,038.19

Item No.

One (1) Only, 9,900 Lb.
GVWR Truck Crew Cab
and Chassis with Special
Service Body and
Hydraulic Lift Gate.

$46,341.00

$43,606.28

$41,412.03

Item No.

One (1) Only, 9,900 Lb.
GVWR Truck Cab and
Chassis, 4-Wheel Drive,
with Special Service
Body and Hydraulic Lift
Gate.

$52,156.00

$48,008.87

$48,068.57

Item No.

One (1) Only, 9,900 Lb.
GVWR Truck Cab and
Chassis, 4-Wheel Drive,
with Special Service
Body and Hydraulic Lift
Gate.

$58,489.00

$48,008.87

$57,785.00

Item No.

One (1) Only, 15,000 Lb.
GVWR Truck Extended
Cab and Chassis, 4-
Wheel Drive, with
Special Service Body
and Crane.

No Bid

No Bid

$116,458.57

Item No.

One (1) Only, 15,000 Lb.
GVWR Truck Cab and
Chassis with 1.5 Cubic
Yard Water Level Dump
Body and Hydraulic Lift
Gate.

No Bid

$55,883.15

$53,702.65

Item No.

One (1) Only, 15,000 Lb.
GVWR Truck Cab and
Chassis with Flatbed
Stake Body and
Hydraulic Lift Gate.

No Bid

$55,463.06

$56,285.53

NOTE: These figures are preliminary or apparent bid results of the date of bid
opening. All bids are subject to evaluation.




